cu8oni

&§®amn @d’ébc 28I EB
MO FEFTMEU SIEVIIVSLD
OFFICE OF THE CABINET OF MINISTERS

~ CABINET DECISION & DeBDE Boeww imWESTmOUS Sijloned
Oed gome: g®e/22/0098/310/004 2022 @858 ®es 01 3.
8oovx:
B5nReB eEHd.
BBeBSs.

85o®ms eCmd.

o Bm gPoimsrned eE®.

8¢ g@msrened eE®.

a8moen g@isned eCo®.

OnE® iFvm a@imvrned eCHd.
28Ee®5Tned ewIznwm eEHd.
BB emYdust sdsoem.

B €nmBBB.

B D€ @
Bedn g@imsi-ned eCmd.

1979 @2 48 ¢o0m PpEODE OreTDed
(2020820 25)) BB EWI E3-CRT

(Bedn oo #:08n® 9i8ux me 2022-01-20 E59B w-od®w)

2022 2008 ®e 24 & S OUSHeE a®ms O duded ved
RBoenwn eDms »OED 8ew 0O 0w O H1B.

(G
Fh)

Q&éb.é@%.@é.gmozﬂg
¢®ms OBl eCE™d.

34. g®os BRAC sFwo gom 22/0098/310/004 g, “1979 geoz> 48
et gdmOoqca e S8e® (MO™ED® 8882m) smyn 36200
0oeaddsy’ ® ©ews’ dodn HPBR® @Ilsx »e
2022-01-20 8xnB eweodnw - (s g 21/2121/310/019
BEaecH § 2022-01-10 B g OeFOC Boewwd gpEd)
PuD 85Ny 3.0dRw Y #OBHed NiFuen 5w

_>2

000 Boemwn 8PAsTDews] 0@56 cuo-@é 20 mlzﬁ@a go@» @0 2H® WGEwns 0112325279 ewd 0112422276

s - P _m A a R




e ACH 2 00 BEAed womdih BBe®x=3 SRR D,

- 02 -

s 8wzl 888 an@Bw cas 200 Bdew wom 8

®

(i)

©Wogred @ om0 A7, pedmdcn
nETOed (2008 SRBD) (e3°:0@dD%)
o emPdun Sved mwd vyed sg B3O
5€®0; €58

un ()8 wewsy 888 !ed syed sg won
CO® OB sod omgdsm, @ gmRG®
O 8w B8&es 28BedsInd0 9Bux B8
€.

20¢, 000 Boemw 8OO» WY 1§ od RO, 1)
goms WOUD ©WeM gpE DCBEY 0dn 00O Boers 3D
@180 ewewr g OHEDEed eEHmO®O DCEw 510800

Roenw »o» 2.

Bwo me gn:

\

8Oesxs:

Begn g@iasrms - Qum RNdFses wo
™0 .

Exn8e8 eE®® - s-odned 8dsma wo
own BoFven wo eO m.

BBoBn® - wedned B8ounm © 9wum
A8 Fves wo 0200 aym.

8903 eCEd® - wedned 8dum ®o
evn HoFven wo e e».

PoTem §gLIBRD - e.odned 8dsms
0 Qn RBTees wo @0 .

8¢C a®omsoe@cs

g3moen g@imrawe - edned 8dsms
0 @ BBees wo eO .

Pudn gpoFen gDimwans - sedned
Bovmd w0 gun ABFven wo 0200 arm.
28Eed5Ined swiznwm eEHn®

A8 omQdex wdugm - wedned
Bounn v gun A8Fves w 000 am.




A decision of the Cabinet Meeting held on 2022.01.24

34.

Cabinet Paper No.22/0098/310/004, a Memorandum dated
2022-01-20 by the Foreign Minister on "Amendments to the
Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act, No.48 of
1979"  (Cabinet  decision  dated 2022-01-10 on CP
No.21/2121/310/019 refers) the above Memorandum was considered
along with the observations of the Minister of Finance. After
discussion, it was decided to grant approval -

(i) to publish the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary
Provisions) (Amendment) Bill attached to the
Memorandum in the Government Gazette; and

(i) to present the said Bill to be published in the
Government Gazette as per (i) above, thereafter in
Parliament for approval.

It was also decided to treat this decision as confirmed and to
authorize the Secretary to the Cabinet of Ministers to convey the
same to the relevant authorities for necessary action accordingly.

Action by: Foreign Ministry - above observations annexed.

Copied to: Secretary to the President - copy of Memorandum and
above observations annexed.
Attorney General - copy of Memorandum and above
observations annexed.
Secretary to the Prime Minister - copy of
Memorandum and above observations annexed.
My/Defence - copy of Memorandum and above
observations annexed.
My/Finance
My/Justice - copy of Memorandum and above
observations annexed.
My/Public Security - copy of Memorandum and above
observations annexed.
Secretary to the Leader of the House of Parliament
Legal Draftsman - copy of Memorandum and above
observations annexed.

Checked by ¢ l(\/ ....... i

:
2 .u...-..\ﬂég,\ !
oy &

\




BE@ DB 39

B DImIDFa
MINISTRY OF FINANCE

nednd® DRVmeEns, emed 01. Qswevsid, Qamapby 01. The Secretariat, Colombo 01
& @otmd @6vmiena ' Sri Lanka
DRBQB (94)-11-2484500 ooSe3 00D a08a
DIVICUCVSBLD § (94)-11-2484600 Quaerd (94)-11-2449823 Qoult &L f ww treasury.govk
Office (94)-11-2484700 Fax Website
ko] ezom?@fa ®ed ego%? %mé)] } v{'
sT6I%l @60, 2 105 @ev. &
My No. MOF/DG/LAD/C0/09/2014 Your No. CP 21/1215/303/097 Data 2022.01.

&®amwae@es

88w 0o e

ewdszn/ocEB®

BB Fw e

Do /aaqcp/g,, Ofcocf

8Os D 3008w
8¢ g0 Swred RBSu e

Bede mOyn

1979 qom 48 eces DEDDe DEEBe® (0mBm
B8Bam) ey 8360 Beerldm

2021.01.20

B ewsl ewrddsn wewr §Oums Dol an®Bn
godFu emed.

(@) 4%m» oedde eodesd s@en B Y Eo “o”
\ 8 oy 1979 gom 48 coen DS DigDe®
(200208 BB8om) vy escerdRme BBe®

s emYdun.

() ©© vord emYdom med vyed s B8O,

(@) ©0® oo emyen FDOBe wgw SGed®xvnd
©0n @2Bux /88,

owddszn sewm OmewedS,

NBE Gotseste, .0,
e g@oms

—_—



22/0098/310/004

FOREIGN MINISTRY
CABINET MEMORANDUM

Cabinet Memorandum No: fm [Ag4- | 22 lcmlo4

Amendments to the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act No. 48
of 1979

1. Background

1.1 Pursuant to Cabinet Memorandum No: 21/2121/310/019, dated 03 December 2021
submitted by me on the above, the Cabinet of Ministers by paragraph (ii) of its decision
dated 10-01-2022, directed the Foreign Secretary to submit the draft Bill along with the
Constitutional Certificate issued by the Hon. Attorney General through the Fore1gn
Minister, for the consideration of the Cabinet of Ministers.

1.2 Accordingly, the Bill drafted and finalized by the Legal Draftsman and a copy of the
Constitutional Certificate issued by the Hon. Attorney General, confirming that the
proposed amendments ‘are not inconsistent with the Constitution are submitted
respectively as Annexes A and B.

2. Recommendation
\

Given the above, the appréval of the Cabinet of Ministers is sought:

(a) for the draft Bill amending the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act
No. 48 of 1979, at Annex A; '

(b) to gazette the draft Bill; and

(¢) to place the draft Bill before the Parliament for approval.

20* January 2022 ..

Foreign Ministry, Republic Building, Colombo 01, Sri Lanka.
"Tel.: +94-11-2430221. +94-11-2325412. Fax: +94-11-2430222




Annex A

B on@usf m@mqw ©¢8nedsHnd
UL eusmIB- Senemndseind

Legal Draftsman’s Department

oz% 80, B0 es 0Om, emog® 12, 858 o &Ho oMo, omIc®
Bev0. 30, SiHsHeT WG, Qesrr@u)u 12. P.O. Box. : 554 ‘ Telegrams  : DRAFTSMAN, Colombo
No.80, Adhikarana Mawatha, Colombo 12.
§0mOm / OgneneoCué / Telephones : 011-2333394 Website : www.1d.gov.1k ousfed/ Qused/Fax @ 011-2325185
Accounts Branch : 011-2421022 Email  :admin@ld.gov.lk 011-2384579
Legal Draftsman : 0112542991 011-2435935
®od gome ' @0 gozDes . gme
s Geo. L.D.-0 1/2022 21051 Bev. L/POL/429-1 Bag 13.01.2022
My No. ) Your No. Date.

Secretary

Foreign Ministry

An Act to Amend the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act, No.48 of 1979

I write with reference to your letter dated January 13, 2022 in respect of the above.

The final draft on the above is sent herewith.

S2—

Kumudu Dissanayake Sgd. Deepthika Kulasena
Assistant Legal Draftsman Additional Legal Draftsman
(Tele. 0112542992) For Legal Draftsman

Copy ~ Hon. Attorney-General




EE.D.-8 112022

1979 gom 48 ¢0 WESmDIGw D1 1EDe® (0miBm B8ABMm) vmm

£300@30MB BEO ©wwr § ommS.

B oo gdonsifm @@ dmdded ©lbcedsind B85 eded

ODHET) EOR.

S8 980 l. @® oo 2022 gom ¢0m mEdmdice MEeESed® (50mBm
BBBDIm) (300@Idm) v eI HEBIOT E1ED.

1979 gom 48 2. (008 8530 "gdi ywdBn” 0neds? seos’ B0y @) 1979
S omes 9 @ozm 48 30 BEmDICH NEDe® (mOdmEn BEBMm) smest 9 On
O DoOBIB . . "
o esme DB, O8 (1) O codosiBed and Bdimed "®ies ¢ 30» s
STICT O ALY
880 G DO ©OPNIO "Bim epeyd e m DO wedsn 8Sedn3
00857 Boeridms 20T Cred.
gz T3 gn ygdBed.9 O DosiB00 eEdB ® svn ciSedn acs
owdBed 9¢ D8 es ®0m G ¢u0, & 0B & yreBed 9¢ ew g DOBIS
& 90 DosIB
ece SO B G -
e 860
"G5 mBed® 9¢. (1) 9 O DwsIBG B3OS O™
. Buded ol ¢ Be®s ae O moEdmy Seds
i Boomes
Fe SEom D g8 Bhms 88D qisless »0F
BewtdmiDdad

056 B @ @O Rlcisldatialelsimclol 2lnsen
em0WBes BE ¢, OO dedednpstdsuy
odm, § Buded woBn we 8Ooms,
9g0 DoOBIRG Y@ICD OO KDy Bed
Bme NEE®O @ eI DVISED
DICEB®DS e EIPO0 e EedSe
g .

(2) 8 G ©50 8w
0208853 e300 883 D DD ¢
oems’ 8855 1996 gom 21 e §
Co @0 BB® o885 300D
BBHHD Y@ICO Ogdr onBe® Sz
NEBO @® e, 9 O DosIBo




S o Pe®
SSms B0
3®
PertnuEddwed
oo O

wdesl OO oot deby  m@®
BEacd O woment 28 Om Lo
93D 8 Eozn ®nd Ben® wen®ass
2350 0dn osBedme @I (B

9¢0. (1) (¢® dDozxBed IO
‘0] 0edsI s’ 0T CRAD)
S o Be® Buea ggg Om ey,
1994 goz» 22 &0y DAEOD e g
a0, 3®15)8n vl Brn eSS0
3] ¢QOBDED HedBd 8§ o
omes BBV BEeEdr e ®rencd
203810 835 DO weBm 23 e
e®I, 0D nBe® CB®ID nE 8Os
BB8ewlsl ©1® Pand O OISO
Cgdr Bed® ddims MBBD ® 9g
DosiBed (1) O codesIBG g@ISd
O mPe® NBw@um wuwSm 20m» G
B0y IS) a8 233 ®
Penedntddoned ® mBee dsiess

.

) 1) O codosiBed
@ wrw, O mPed® G
NEOD v Bewednstddu BE3ss-

(@) ownd yleBmd
R eorm DO
(S TEaerco]
BENNDBCS,
BPENIDHE o O®
od; 08 Jgdn
HDe® eddomedd
Sedo DGO
83353053 O
OBOLs B3OS ¢




. 5
LS 1o
2B,

@

(@) espdied
RE8Fwen &%)
I1DIDOY B3
288o8 0z 8
1S @3®
e BBEES
Dabmnonn 880,

OZ) ¥ g .

(3) ey DAE®D e B a
QO  Ooundpsiddmed  @mo O
2SO &, ©ed¢s vl enns wgmo
O® aalmzmézegazmd@i @edes BEAS6
00 988ed WO eEes ¢ O® eedes
BEOSw) 8853 Pewmednustdse edn &
BEAT Db 988 mom eces &
Vewdgiddw 88x B =om
C1P6 OIS .

(4) o D080 o 8 B
QOO OB eedes BELOGed Dibsmd
B85 owg¢dd® O gded%Om &,
Penedmsiddur 88 68 emod
gons 0ed¢s yYBmIC cRr €O erwm
8o 000 sy Sy @&s @G .

(5) OO Bemo quon& edfemn
CR 83> ooNd dedBD @ecd
B move wo®» 850 ocm
BSOSO oS Oy 8&es, mom
cald Bonm edm O0%® 8Bgacd
Bobemwws  @o®» mom e




SenednsiOsw) DEul wwBelonBRdsu

edm B RO ¢ ENZY (I (£ .
ALY 4. 5 rEBed 10 9 deuiBe c®B GOBHS & EDHOO Lo
Emoned 10 el dosiSe mede ©oy Eed:-
Oz dosIBwn
aBewuidmn
S8 "9 O DoziBw 10. 9 O DoriBe wdedw @wO» ¢
@ded § Bodos qdwonsi®m 8a gn  gnd,
He®w
© 3030 DrDENEd 126 D DuOIGD
§De305030 ‘
B g @O o) 140 O DsdBS%ND wderS § BB
DG & 010 B8g BB mamson &
o B8 aedwdwmon € gdm 0y
EBICTDG L .
gom 5. 5 ygdBed 10 O Desi8ed eEdsd ® vvn Eeds ags
o=dBed 108 HuuiBn armes ©0zy GAm gm0 B3 O gedSed 108 dosiBe ecm
Doxis
TR RSO B g -
qpes 888
“BBEOSHO 10g. (1) @® so» @des’ 80 wmided
83 wided el exf dg8® wided mA® ¢ DSHY
\ A¢8® woded Bewulino m65 SRBwdiand, 6® omm

80 mondgon sOes 06 3¢ BewlodEx Bwd® 0
edn geda 5O

oD 850 CIR8 B emisledBOED «dsD ewd
@ 90 oo Bdm BBom 8B eced
B @ded & onoEtm  edn
geded®d ©» & mmBlon edxeds’
Bewldmus? 8y 8600 a88s 830 gn

c3.

(2) @® oo WOes 83 ®mided
e»f de@® wded o 88m
DIMBRD  8Fn NBed B3I8Dm
oeEd g ©8f dged @B ©wde
853Bedemn BSO w'q‘a)oé;éi%cs B @n

.




[SIAL}o

o dBed 11
O DoslBo
£30eRIDZD
88

6. g gwdBed 11 m Souific vvn ¢udedn ©8E 08lsd

20D ®IY) (21eH:-

(1) 8 (1) B ¢ OsIBEd PEPRO ® von feds Eodes’s
e B560s5:-

(1a) (1) O codosIBe wdew »o» c¢ HBodw
gcog O53es! B® D EBORO ¢, 99 Bo®a & B0
00 E00 euC Ry eedes clEfsenus W glmow
eed¢sn BEAden 0dn gfss me gy evd, admden
eedes HBeddwy B8x & omdon ©®asidess’
D00 R B Gry .

(1) (1) D codosiBa wden’ O B¢ Bunss,
58 Buds gqoe O53es’ B mimnd ¢, & ot
6280 BIpned =m0 dcwndmBidconed g&mdencs
o100 RE ¢ OO BewednNsiddn 853 & sy SmD
208 @y o0, J om0 & Be®w ©0ED eed &
DB ONED C & em@B D ewunSn 88O e
(1g) coPosiBed ¢ 1B gdmden eedes BEOIwed
DD, Benednsidde edm 9tbnst we g .

(Ig) (1g) codoriBe «desd gdmdes ©edES
BeAdw B8s 8losl mOm @¢ Dmd 08z &
BB 8638@6) cm O g1 @D engecd O gdEOm
g, ODowemsidcey 8858 & mostnd gdes eeden
B@IC GO eI B oD 2O G0 g ©.

(lg7) D2® 8Bewd g8 odcon c@ 85»
NSO DESHD a;eﬁdc@‘ B8 mamvos @d®» S8
G BBOBDI@O :B O B8&Be, mom cal Som
DZ® BEAcD DOTamns pd®» O ecEes

: »_@@3}6@3;;5@55@3 8853 eeREnB00i edn B 88O ¢

89 DE ;D .

(2) 88 (3) O» codosiBed qmd; diwed " ¢» s wm
DO 0DHDO "Bt eoewE wm DO» aedsn SBeds;




gloz
odBed 14
O DozIBe
9O 88®

oz
oxd8ed 15
Om BesIBo
o@D
868

gl
gxdBed 15¢
O DoziBas
©oemiDme
868

8oz

o dBed 1560
ey Dozmila
qupes 880

(3) 08 (5) O codnLIHia TS & eOHDD wean cF3edHz

COVOBBY grodsn BBe® .-

5 () O cePO5IBG O 2888w 8853 mm ce
Bo®s edeirsi®n S g2 oud, 280 Sudo, eRlorManTO!
OsOE%eD 126 O DDe3d e 140 O O3DeEND wdess §
B8 oo & oo B8g B8 wamsom g ound 88¢
gdmdenum & yudn D07 eCIRG gy .

7. gy ywdBed 14 O DoriSo e®Dss @I Oy E1ed.

8. 30 gwesBoed 15 O desific o8 2) O coPOBWO 9S8
® vom qFedmm ags coPosIBes dan 880 00Bx3 soenidmes
20T C1Ed:-

‘(3) 2@mJened Omcs 30 Dobnos e g euolcletals)

¢DeNom 2&31@@ O »E) B 2068 BB emi SYS 1k Yaro
0 2CE680 B8 wwom dxfest »H® B, 08 omm Oes
O 7@ »E Bwiwws ® mesmo O30 gy .

\9- By yrEBed 158 O Deni8e &8 (1) &2 cedosiSed “19(&)
DosBed” @r DOm esm QDB ©OROD "19 O DeBeE” wm DOm
0 9ETD® pedn SBe®s @B B0Ri0mE @iy EEd.

10. 50> ygdBed 15¢ dex3Bwd 9B @ vom creds elo]
DosIBG ames @07 D and, Ao H® &dBed 158 DoniSa ClG1es)
ACI®m By @ -

89 weded Ba. o8  omes 5380imoed
@3, T = a 08O e R
Zgi@mod@d wOen’ 80 wised emnd ded® eded m»Han
Dm0 B moEion ¢uie0.e0d on can &
oo o 80 80 ®ges OPEYE QD@ nsT 08303 O®

6




[elALT-))

.gcz;d&ea?.i;- B

D2 BomBe
gBewidma
880

DD (HND SEERE Hon 08 Bwovo arc®s
D3 NI »d, DI ewi Iy
CORedY BBwdSern B8 oY otulote)
e @88ss! mdm G¢ oGRS esey
480D wns BBy DB @res

Om Bewed m3m 8o S ¢

el 80 ¢ 08 dosiBed 85 g
888D 883, 15 O deriBed (2) O
CODOIBG tOes Ondmcens S8x3, 8
Bewove gdesss D0y EI® ©® BB
83 maded 51300 310 207 E18e®3
eSSBS Be, 0298 g o

oed 8O ¢ D0, &dedicryn
9008 00 dHdmSeneud ®®Iz) WIS
CR oienl »® 020 md Oec8d ¢, O®
G500 90080 58 Bmvos & ©®IZ
S8e® &» 80 & eQers opsifed®st
830 @@ O emES gOeEGm g,
Olmiens 883, §8mw B85 omi RIS)
eONeds! BB%OSon B85 mtmotic
BGED BI®D R 9E898= Sl NG
B e O Bewed 8800 Y]
@@@ CiPs 18 ..

L g gwEBed 19 O dexiSo VTS & 050D oww
Bedn dosiBe geds nom cred:-

o

o C8®D
e o® 8w
BROc 838D
e® oo wders
w® D3¢
eddcovn c@
DT
Qg om08u @
213}

19. o0 ©® B BSom
BB >OE o= BSOSO g ¢, ©@d
ODD 0 1@ OF¢mO w® aBmcenas
B€3s3 DIETT T Cq ©81® oo ®
2 O6maOR 8OO Be0BD o Bxd
ODOB 3¢ cOOO VecBd 380Dy
et 9i8us s Bges ¢ @8wOms




B3I s I EED ene OO oo sioy 8335
ol ode gy w

v 80050 8mC g BRs8

OvaBebde  addcron D0wde g,
a8 wrDmSmSenc 8366 o8 BROT) 13
S @3® MBI EBOED wdsHD OB 3®

DN @1 O Bewed e oS ..

909z 2. 9 gwedBed 26 95 o5 205 =5 & 005D som
g dBed 26 ueds OO ego@{’c{) 0B Cred:-
O DR
uBewidmes
568 "Beddswst 26. (1) ® oo cdes) 0 3¢ ©®
IO gadisend Bo®wsS oo e e ©0® Bdimos
880Vews greElm® Osducied 126
OB DDEND emnd 140 Dz Ordedcnd
@Oenl BBmamsam & yam 205 8o
015 .
) )] D coDo5ISe
BRBDOED O, ©® oD BOes!
DO g W® Bdws ewmid ®¢» ¢ ©®
\ Bz 3O DO G¢ owd O ces
BICOWBIZN g ¢ w3éwdens mEH G ©md
| BG0e0s B0 @S cqedBs  =®
FodE o0f ecom w®BIDews 3®
BEASeO eod MR Do 883
en g0 ®HEO, 00Jem0 ewd B
D0 @00 [BO evme am ..
o B. gl ggedBed 31 05 D038 emm eds ©88 @83
sxdBed 31 Boeald®G oDy E1ed:-
Oz DosIBas
@@ B3I
886 (1) "gDusB esmyes” 3o esge® gbo Bowens 9d5 BBed s,

(2) "§eemoEs” wm eaged® gbv Bowens 9 BEe®s3;



.:h

eOPCHIOS
a8 § 8
o o
€003

QAo 1IBw
g @D.

(3) "Belbm mo@on” wm bl Boimsnd @EE8D ® oo

csedm gl Bdivens gmes S88c853:-
‘DORD" wBImO 1994 @om 22 (S> DO e aBns
Dud, ¢HnBm owl Boom o eEd00 v’
ROBOED DedBd & =89Bw vmm sdes &
@ug®0 o¢» ¢ gbda @ Bix g .

4. 0® om0ed Bone s e¢®¢ 131 &I #md od @BBYHCEO
15 DDe®ns, O8O, BonE ®18) 300G DESOBE o .




g.alg. 1/2022

S(HBHLQUIWIT.

1979 Spid Syemiigss
48 b BQevEHF
FLL G

9 o Wfleneus
BBDHBIS60-

(PSTEMDE
FLLOUTSSHH0

98 LHmd 9oy

sietepid Lifleysenen -

2_LUGSSHIH60.

1979 o opeiigal 48 opid Gevds, LWEISTMTSS SEHUY (HDeTe0s
gOUTHB6T) FLLSMNSS HHSHIUSDETTQHTMH &L Ib
Qeommnass FeoipTws Garsedss

GQWISST  UNTITEHLORTMEHETT 60

Uesteu@ponm FULI0TSSUUGUST G -

1. @&gL1b 2022 LD SLEWIGET .....
sbBUY gouUT(Beer)

D A60&H, LWLIRIBTUTSHS
(smereds

(PHES5&) FLLID o160
61(HSHHIBBTLLLILIL60TLD.
2. (Bs155HII 66T “(PBETENIDE FLLOITGSLD” oT601
GOUIGEsIWOLBL) 1979 oL opemigst 48 oub B,

vwmsrass SbHUY (Bnerels gnurhsst) slisdar 9 o Ufley,
g (1) b 2 Liflessrsn sriyarsssHeo, “uHOal @ wrs
sreLuG me” aai@ibd CFThHeEEnsGl uHoors “UasICIaIF WTss
sTeolLG &Hullenest” STETERILD

BsasTHNIHSSULBESTMSI.

QsTmeemen B\(BeussiteLpeoid

_\3. WpaFiens FLLaTeEaSHS 9 b ildmen 2 L aiGHg tsiaum
ydw Ofleysst  @QHsred 2 yGSsULBHaDaICaTUSIL &1,  Bleney
SIFFLLOITSESHHM 9o whmud 92y, aaiend fleysenTasll LULIEIMISHEID

Geuswi(hLd:-

“SBHHIDUBSD o1 (1) geaugmd Ofelaidy opssiulL
i sLLemenulal  sTamiUGSsOul L OFHowreiy),
FTEPUILGSSL . " . . .
Wt 5l IHHMBW BLLn6T elouauTal QHrLiileonaiGgm
EHour@ides OMIL DicueuTel SHSSIMeuGSILLL BLID 61HS
25"“3'%5’”“@5@ bleumesie BH ML Uiedeniei
ouemi(BLb. .. .

SAMWHHOTNCHT  Sbs BHaurandE, 9o

agigid  Uflellar  Pudselaiug  obKEHeure
DIBSMBL  SESHIOUSEHETET DI 515G

QFevousnETS BlsmwioretGeun(y



ECEL

EUBH BB 6
BLBHSGF
QESDEG
BHeunenb @ eien
SHLENW.

STOILGHUNDET Bl HH B IQUISTHSHULBSH

Beusmwi(HLD.

@) egeaustd dfelaidy souBraionst
HBHHSIDUGSILBSOTHGHI, 1996 Spd  SpemTIgsn
21 o @evss, @eomns Wweals o fisst
opmemsGIE FLLSHE 28 oy Uflalen
Pudsefaiug, Gemins wwale o fewss
S}, 668018 (& (LTI T 60 sifsmrwsissiul L
DL B6IT DFFLLGHeN Budsefleuig
SHHHIDUSHDBTN AL SFIGGF CFOuHDHSETS
Aoomiensd afle o MEHeT JLMENBE WDMSES
aelssiubhaed Gausmi(HLo.

9oy. (1) Ufley 9o efer (1) opd 2 LiSifleden
Budssfsiiig SBHBIDUBBD
&L LenenGQuimeiest FramIuuBHSUULL
WyHowrstenpl QumisTen @eileum BHlourenid
(Budfellsd “sHlaH® 1530108 16T
SIIGOswwILGY) FHEEBs HUT, 1994 S
Sget 22 b Bevds, SHsHgaums HDID
Goumyl OaT@yoner, WeNSTIIDTEIDHD  Sl6V6VS]
SPHBHIOTE  BLOBIGH V0D SHEWIPHHE0

erssTUsUMHMDH Qb gy ment FLOMTWF FLLSSH0
gourGOsFwwnuCL SlTHS L
LI GIB T S BLILIH UGS o_mIHiuBHHINSDE,

sLLeneT  steusutsit  QamLiurenBsr  isusurerilen
ShHoImuSENsTE BLE516GS SBHBIMUSID
sreolugHIsGurg  @eaibeurp  DTSHIHNID
SEHGODHHS  OSLmaubuid  GFsauz
TS SLOWLWTHO Geuswi(Bio.

Q) @imd o COfelar CrresssesTs,
gBaaid  sGIBMUBIDETE  BLEBIBGHE
Qaevdleiny Haleumet-




(2 ap6ss BUED Crrguinash

unreneuuii(ha 60 Gouemi (hOLaTLGL 651
DOUTH  BEOUTIDE,  BFiomevest LOM@ILD
DISSHMBW SBHBIMUSS DB T
BLeHD  sieui SIbBleneventoaefeatap
V(L2 NHGEAE N

DIBBENONDS 61T sIQTLTUM M

S LFISEIHeND Gousmi(Bid;
(o) oB6ss BuTUDDIW SIISTEILIL|EB MM LD
ghBras mHuT Qeruiwdsagu  gBseb

empUUTLeLWD  udged Geusmi(BLd.

G)  eBGse pul  AsHraumsss

2 _Lu(BsHsUuLIgMHESEHeoT Qs Hleumest
SlufyrwiuGOL sy, BFeunsit,  wmSseuL
uflGsramensarss FLL-D(HSH S
SleVieue Qg heulesi(pestes(t FHBH® BLIT
BDISSULG S0 CoueihOweaInd SiGsHmEL F1 L -
LO(HSGHl6u Sisvieusviflestmed BAeuTenid @
Sifléens Qe FTINSSILGE560

Gouewi(hOwenmid  Liesfla 60D,

4) FH85H® LT é]ggjgwmg)é@
2_LuGSsILL HeirenmQiyer DGSHMHBW  FUL-

LOHSHFEI6U Sigvisusvflest N EX=0Y: 3
OeuefidasT Bl gs, AU 6 S BUBHSE
Sieudunomest ID(hS SIS Hdsenaemw
BULDTEIS UBANS) B&leunss Cxrsmen

BLLDETOWITRTIND 24,5(3860 Gouesmi(Bip.

(5 AsFrausmsenuin yfibaisiensuQyens
CEE TG0 S0 ATTES  GHDelwed
SUPEGBL OIS MSHM6T S CETRULSHEGF



(PSTEMDF
FlLUTEE S 6
10 opb Wfleneu
wampB CEuigen.

(PSHREDLDE
FLLUTSHSHH60
1031 eI
Wifleneu

2 LUGSHSHIH60.

FLLSHHINMDSH HEMEVEMLOWIHLH ML
AueFLeuisusmssF FrTsauulL HoHyeuengs
Q&L TNevme yevsamuiGleur sTenms
QSHTLBIGLOLIGU LD Qursda ufiGensai

SEmeVMLWIH LS W HAUTE LewllbH60mLD.”.

4. oHiend FlLaTesSH@ 10 o ey @ssTed Besiul(h

s udeorsl Haeumw Uifle @LuuGslaimg:-

“9 gy
Ifelesrebipmen
SLL 6T
Boighuren

Srpe0 Couewi(Bid.

5. (WHAMWDEF  FLLOUTHBHHEN

10. gawustd Jdfelady  oyssiulL
BLLsmemuimestm BmIFuT T ST He0
Gousmi(HOLoaTLIGIL T SFFutevsnotiniest 126 b
SleVeug 140 o 2 miyengulsidipmen
aUPHGBLOHMBHMNe  Haly, eTeneuBuied
QUPHGBLAIYHMBHETNED  DeVVGH FBHemId
gl BHOBTIMSHH60 Baeneild@ L ubhs sl
UBHIOTHTSHL.” .

10 g UJflwey o LerBaau

Jeeumpd ydHw difley Besmed 2 LGssuuBanbsaugsiiar  @a!

SFFLLaTESSHET 1001 eiaignid ifleursl LweimiGeid Geuswi(hd:-

\
\

“ellenssodiuedlsd
SIVEVG
SBUYSBSTOIEND
2_eiien

24, Q6T (H U SHETET
DI HHMBE
FLLSgeOuImheut
Qe hSHSH0
Bouemi(BHLd.

1001, (1) @FsliLsHady elenssiomiuisdled
@i SiVVG  HHHHITEUBBLLIL L
Syl UySplgsgeiubGsaidlan
FLLSSTel RUHOUIT, QFFL L SHHBID
SLBHUULL RupriGeldsefsicpsold
G HIM [T SBUILIL & FnlgUIGUTDTES BISHHEN B
WBILIE & 65 60T (6TH & B EMLOWLL DI6V6VG] Geum)
61(1pSHF60Teut FLLSH60
gmurGOFIWNLL Leurmrs DGHSHMBUW
SLEHHBTHT  DEWHBHMBUID — DHHMSUI
apeflargniiled (penpuihsmend GFuieusmHE@w
o flen@srenigheHsHed CouswmiHo.




(2) @sslLgdamsp efsnsswfiuaden
@i TV | SHHIIMaUSHIUL L
o, Q66U s1(LpSHBHlevmest FLLSH60
gourGOswwiL L ammrss, ST G|
o_meleu (TS (6ThL 681 QarLiTyQsreisausns,

2 _MenwbsTamigmose Cousmi(Hd.”.

(PSHENDE 6. (paHmwE FlLamsssHE 11 b 1My Bss1h  dersumlonm
FLLOUTES 560t Q@éﬁ)ﬂu@lﬂ@m@li'

11 o Wensug

Hodsi60. 1) o (1) o o Liflon o Lai@ss Uesteu(mid

2 Ciifleysemst o L@ sanuseateps(iptd:-

“lon gumd o Liflelaidp oyssiu L  srL st
61b& D6l GBTLIUTCHT Sibhs o6, SISSHMBW BLL 6N
DBBMEL  pEHEGE  CarilssiuGapsienit W(HSHIEUL
ufiGengmanssns @@m UL - WHSSH6 Sigvieueviledt (estemiT
POSSIUGSVID ASSHEBW D6t QBT TiTsd FLL-D(HSH S0
Sigieusvfleamed SiNldensQUITETm) FTONSSILHSID
Geuewm(BLb.

(1) QUMD o _Uiiflelsiidip SBEUULL
SLLEMOUNSID], DHESLLDET  sTaleuTeir G TureGgr
DIBICUT(ETH (), é;é;g;sa)&suj 24601 61b BHouneles B upenmi
Aiflelled sughalemm Gy b S &leuneflentms0
CeiisasiuGssd GousmihOwsTLgL 6 2 Uiilfley (1) elsd
GSOUIGOsWIWNUCL UL - wmssie Siieusofiesr sifleaams,
DISHHMBL DLEDHESG DSSHM B &L emer
CorulssiuBusian  oiBgmew oy SsHyouens s,
2_LuBSaUULYHESaTs06m60 STETLIZH 6D 65T
2 DIFLUBGSSIUBDEG BHeuTai(Ipsienit arewilssiubGsand
Gausmi(pLo.




(1®) 2 Ciflsy (1o eleidy sl —  wiHHSH6
SisvieueufleiTed  cupmIBLUULL NGBS JASHMBW D6
HeHgeuens @ 2 CubsHsuulGerenrQyaiums
OeuellsaT BUILSS,  BHoumer,  JSHMBUW  DLEBHHEG
Suflwionen  wHHGHINF  HEFmFmw  aupmIGuSHOBHIS

Cararen s LamenQuITaienm 91&5@&HH60 Gousmi(hLd.

(1w) faFrauengemuils yfibgiensreublyens
FTTHSUUGSETM eSO HTTHS (& HmeNuisd
AUPSHGHLAIYSMBEMENS  QHTHUUSHGHF  FLLSHIODS
semeenwHudenw  QuenFQeulisusnsams  FTTSHHUULL
feyeuengs Qaruirdleomest yevenrmuiGeumsstenmg
Osrumigwugun Quredal uflGsrasiT SHemevenwHudlenut

Baleurest uesslldbae0mid.”.

2) st (3) o 2 LifNa@Esra sTUHUTESSH, UGl 6
O HEIBEHEBE) STSTEILD QFTMHHEHHGL ugdleonas
“ussiefGiyewi(h LOTHEBIBEHBE ™ SIGTEILD QarmhaensT

B BOUSRTPEOIPLD;

3) owa (5) op 2 Lifleney Bedel (b ssHSGU udsonsl
\ Weteumd o Uilflenen @ Beousaiepeoptd:-

“(5) @rmb o Lilflelaidy oemwssfamed opsetiul L
aslll_anm@mrrsoi@ BmFUTETHT H60 BGeueutt(hOssTLIG L 66T
Sy Fwevsniotiles 126 ob  SisveFH 140 oub
o _mityenyullenaSipment SULDE(HBL6UIQHENH B0 SHely,
aTenauBUIID  QUPHGHBLOUYEMBHNED  eVeVGH!  GFEHEYID

FLL paloainsded Gsetald @G uBHSULBSNDTETSI. .

WPBHIMDF 7. wppeimod  slieamsssdar 14 oup  dfley @ssmed
FLLOINESSH HHSUUGHRTS!.

14 o Oieneu

BB 5H60.




(PSSENDF 8. WaaImws FlLeundasHea 15 20 Afley, eoimer (2) Spd

FLLauTh &S A 2 Ldflenss 2 Len@Gaan Neoumid ydw 2 W leneus Gerliugsiepsud
5o Oflemeus . . s LR eles )
B, B55MGS5ILGATE!:-
“3) Bl L sHadpren @eulsum aflsnéapld,
BAIHESHenimed vghwtiu Geussigu BT TN BIBEHDBHT S,
BIosiims et SWrwgHed  elenssid OaTLmIsluGasmen
SIV6VG| QSTLIBSIBLTSSILGuUSmEIL HearGurGeusns,
slflellevdasnen G planeossit DIDIHSHT Qs GUEH1Y: )
DIQUILEHLUTSD BLISSILGZH60 Gouemi(pn.”.
WasEmI0E S, (ppaimIE FULeTESSHG 152 seiemid fley, “1921 ereigmb
FLLOUTESSE e e it G . . S @ .
By Gidbigpup &1 SIGTEILD FTDBEDHHGSGID  6T6U01%H(ETHE(FH LD ufsoras  “19 LI
Ofleneus, Ufleflesi”  ersfienib OsThsemenuyb SIMBMETUID  E(BOUSBEIeLPEVLD
BEi50). B8s1HHOSSILGAGE.
(oeemins 10. (paaimws slLoumsssHar 159 stoiemid  1flemeu 2_L I(BSGI!
FLLUTSSH 56D deiteupd  yHu  1fey B5HHTe0 &Lu@,é,g,ﬂu@éﬂaﬁm@gmugl_sﬁ 85
ey, asigud ygw - Sy n . : .
Sifleney SIFFLLOTGSSFAT 159, eietigond feuras UWIDIDISeud Beusst(Hib:-

2_LUGSSIH60.
. “efendsofiueden ooy, @Fsl1L 5801 giunBmefed (PIIT S

IOV 615 sreusuT MlapLneid, BFFL A
g’@‘:’”&‘mm‘m eflenssonuiedsd ALt D106V
2_6rM6Nn . o e . .

o s ' HhSSBINEUBBUILIL L SO (H6uH QS en
Semerr allendbad  en@EgHGsuILIt L CapFuledmk s
SUDMHIGH60. ueielOyesi®  remisst (W eymmi Vet

Qm_midullyr gminiesr, #b8ss  pufemed
SI6V6VG) SIS sraled LSz ye

@meuflearmed DSDOBE Geunuiu L
elleienTtiugHeiGiosy, Cuosipenmui’ G
BHDSDD  DiHBmBU opementt  enesruled
elBelld s eomb:



opWiest,  eteusurpruied, @ Nfeds
wWwnBurks gour (&6, NI F: 3T
pyeymioeueny 15 ouw  Ifleler  (2) YA
o ifeleidip sTeuGreniomsmen
ellensbaiopluieded B BousmeETe
sLLOMOWIGI®OD 5@l mHa G
BHOSDE®SSH HMLOFUISOTHTS):

opulledt, Gosyitd, HHD
GSDDEHEFTLL UL Lauff Qs rLifed Bosv
BHosmsHed GDmiusiey (peTeneusSIUL (B
Carodiul GeenGar N
GOOEFTLLOU L euHECadrmen eenéLd
DHHMB GarulBaeo GCaHulsdmka
uerenflQy 6o (B LOIT & BIEB 61T pyeymmiesen it
QarLmsrgsionalgg),
GODEhFTL L iUt Leuflenmsd DIVEVGH  DICUTH)
Fririfled FLLSgTemNQITHeuflsmmed
Si5N0saF Oaunutiu’ L
et ILGTEINIEiGod DIH5meWl S, emeiLl
dememuled  elBeliiusenen  Guosd HAOEIHD

BOUTSH G| QBTeensomD.”.

PBTDIDEF ' 1. wasimws slLamsssgdat 19 b Uifley @ssred Basiul

FLLOUTEGSS5H 6T

19 o6 Wiflensu

wrHd® Qeuissd.
“LeneieulprmiE 560
OsmrLitures
gGsaud
s1(1p& Ssvm ot
sLLGFeot
gmuTBSeT
Qs L sHeamdSpnen
DAL
HUNIBGHS
SDDEHFTLL LU L
DLEEHES

2BHGL uFensl s Wfey QLiuGSame):-

19. GauBpBzead siwpddeonen sl LsHar
JoUTBS6NT steuaum L enib,
B&sl LA pren g8 SUMIS &)
DIELTITh BHImSHemmend
GUDSSTIUeNSsIU L o6 euGauThau(HLD,
TG GDUSSTIGCESITE  oiedevg
SIUHBS) LALLM
S DSBS QBHTTS Gwsai(penpui’ B
@IOauTaImm  SieuiT H1H&H0CF I OTeNTT




GOHUEDLUIETEUT ST

sleiug)  eleuaurlpillend,  Guatapenmui

Podee. SriomefdbsiuHbeusny ellendaoiuiedso
DUSHHBHLILBHO Gouai(Bib:

opuller,  esusurprullennd, Gusienmuii B
BADIDLD, S&Hwirest emneuu e
Gusnpsnpuil B HADESIMID
&B(HSH 19 UIEUT DITEN SISHHM B
TBILITH 3 602631 & (61h & & EMLOULL DUSHMSBLI
s1euGyenioTenen sllfelevdasmen

GBlemessiled Nenemuled elBelldbassond.”.
(PBHRIMIDE 12. (papaimws slLamsssdar 26 oy ey @ssTed BasUUL (B

FLLUTESSH6G

26 o Uflemeu

wrmBE Cauised.
“ DIRVIEUEVIT B 61T
(PBHeOWI6UT BEnsmil
UTSISTSHSH60.

25MEG udleorsl Weeumw Wifley GLiuGdaima:-

26. (1) @sslLgdaidp ouésiulL
&L LenemQureim SI6060F] el(Béauu L
uenlilQurem), owdwsvemwoiniar 126 oyb
2_miiyemgulsiEloneT  Sieveog 140 oy
2_MyenFuiRiEneaT aIps G BLagSmBHaM60
Gap6imells @ L LBSSUILIL60ND.

2) QUmD o L Ofelest

LT (HEBEHHHMIDUL, B&s L HHBBD
'é\ga‘;&ﬂu&. ges@Id sLLeneTW  Biedevg

alpsstiulL  gGsad usiiemurll Wesrum)

SI6VEVG deupmieusTes XU
BeOblevemiemSBHIL G  Qeiwiu’ L gGseid
QFwsIEHTS SI6V60GH arflwussisasTs

aeuByenid SiNIHECSHTTS ATV ]
&S  HLTES,  GDDaLEES
210005 Couml Gulwsd Sisvevg &mmedwisd
BULDE (& HL6UIY &6 &I

OzrhasslubBSoTSIH.”.



(P&HEIENLOEF
FUL6UT & 5K 6
31 apid 1 Meweug
EboHHIH6D.

QEUAITENID GHUBLD
sl wig ey Amimen
2_eny GuGsommid

BHmeDd.

3. woSimws slLamsssdar 31 opn Ofley @dstn eisumorm
HpSSULBETDSI:-

(D) “Geuidssrer” sIETTEILD QETELEVENIDLILEBHIT6I

SUMTONEVHBEMHNSD  [HEb(EH UBECLPEO(IPLD;

) “oFssb”

eIIEID  LFTEEUEIDLILGETET  aUMTaTEVHHET S M

BHGUSTIAPEOIPLD; DISSHIL 6T

(3) “GUSBIMISsIULL ST GRUSH  UTNeVHHEIHMS

2 L BHSHI Westaumid suem T ell6VdH HEIH M S

2_LUGSHSHIUBHE PeUpLD:-

“Sapdlyouemns” eistugl, 1994 Sub LW 22 opb E6vHS,

\

e dyeueng omHmd Geum) QaTByLTeT,
DRIHTINOTRIOMY  DVVGI  BPSHSIOTE  BLESHIHE0
VG| HETRSHH  eratusuNPDOsHTen  FoeuTwF
FLLSHDED DIHSH MBI QETsLELEMLOLILH G S
Ghssaissiui L. ACsQUIGMST 2 L WsTEHD

Gousii(HLD.”.

14, Qs gha  Amsen, s 2 orsersdoLGu  gBsHemd
geuaurentd  gOUGL ULFSHD HAmiser 2 emgGuw GuwBeonmd Bibmed

Geusnti(hLd.

10




L.D.-O 1/2022

AN ACT TO AMEND THE PREVENTION OF TERRORISM
(TEMPORARY PROVISIONS) ACT, NO.48 OF 1979

BE it enacted by the Parliament of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka as
follows:-

Short title 1. This Act may be cited as the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary
Provisions) (Amendment) Act, No. 0f2022.

Amendment 2. Section 9 of the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act, No. 48
gffgson 7 of 1979 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal enactment™) is hereby amended in
No.48 of the proviso to subsection (1) thereof, by the substitution for the words “eighteen
1979 months.” of the words “twelve months.”.
Insertion of 3. The following new sections are hereby inserted immediately after section 9
Zi?g:singgle of the principal enactment and shall have effect as sections 9A and 9B of that
principal enactment: -
enactment
“Certified copy 9A. (1) A certified copy of the order made under
g:;:ftieézmmn section 9 shall be made available within a reasonable
served on the period to the Magistrate within whose judicial division
Magistrate the place of detention of the person in respect of whom
such order relates is situated, for the Magistrate to visit
such place of detention, in terms of section 9B.
(2) The detention of any person under section 9
shall be communicated to the Human Rights
Commission of Sri Lanka in terms of section 28 of the
Human Rights Commission of Sri Lanka Act, No. 21
of 1996, for the persons authorized by the Human
Rights Commission of Sri Lanka to visit the place of
detention in terms of that Act.
Duty of the 98. (1) It shall be the duty of every Magistrate
Magistrate to , . . .
visit plgea o who has received a certified copy of a detention order
detention in terms of subsection (1) of section 9A, to visit the

place of detention of the person to whom the order



relates (in this section referred to as the “suspect™) at
least once in every month during the period of
detention, to ensure that the suspect is protected to the
extent provided for in the Convention Against Torture
and other Cruel, Inhumane or degrading Treatment or
Punishment Act, No.22 of 1994.

(2) For the purpose of subsection (1), the
Magistrate who visits any place of detention, shall —

(a) personally see the suspect, and look into
his wellbeing, welfare and conditions
under which he is kept at such place of
detention;

(b) record the observations of the suspect 1
and any complaint the suspect may make.

(3) Where the Magistrate is of the opinion, that
the suspect may have been subjected to torture, the
Magistrate may direct that the suspect be produced
before a Judicial Medical Officer for medical
examination, and a report be submitted by such
Judicial Medical Officer to the Magistrate. i

(4) Where the report of such Judicial Medical
Officer reveals that the suspect has been subjected to ‘
torture; the Magistrate shall make an appropriate order, ‘3
to provide necessary medical treatment to the suspect.

(5) The Magistrate may also direct the Inspector |
General of Police to commence an investigation into
the alleged torture in order to enable the Attorney-
General to institute criminal proceedings against the
person who is alleged to have committed the torture.”.

Replacement 4. Section 10 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed and the following

gﬁf}f‘e’“"“ 10 section is substituted therefor:-

principal
enactment




Insertion of
section 10a
in the
principal
enactment

Amendment
of section 11
of the
principal
enactment

“Order under
section 9 to be
final

“An Attorney-

at-l.aw to have

access to a
person in
remand or in
detention

10. An order made under section 9 shall be final
and shall not be called in question in any proceedings
or in any court of law, save and except in proceedings
under Article 126 or 140 of the Constitution.”.

5. The following new section is hereby inserted immediately after section 10 of
the principal enactment and shall have effect as section 10A of that enactment: -

10A. (1) An Attorney- at- Law representing a
person remanded or detained under this Act, shall
have the right of access to such person and to make
representations on behalf of such person, subject to
such conditions as may be prescribed by regulations
made under this Act or as provided for in other
written law.

(2) A person remanded or detained under this
Act shall have the right to communicate with his
relatives, as provided for in written law.”.

6. Section 11 of the principal enactment is hereby amended as follows:-

(1) by the insertion immediately after subsection (1) thereof, of the
following subsections:-

"(1A) The person to whom an order made under
subsection (1) relates, shall be produced before a Judicial
Medical Officer for medical examination before serving such
order to such person and a report be submitted by the Judicial
Medical Officer in respect of such person.

(1B) An order made under subsection (1) shall be served
on the person to whom the order relates, by the Magistrate in
whose judicial division such person resides and the report of
the Judicial Medical Officer referred to in subsection (1A)
shall be produced before the Magistrate to ensure that such
person has not been subjected to torture before serving such
order on such person.

(1C) Where the report issued by the Judicial Medical



Repeal of
section 14 of
the principal
enactment

Amendment
of section 15
of the
principal
enactment

Amendment
of section
15A0f the
principal
enactment

Officer under subsection (1A) reveals that such person has
been subjected to torture, the Magistrate shall make an

appropriate order to provide necessary medical treatment to
such person.

(ID) The Magistrate may also direct the Inspector
General of Police to commence an investigation into the
alleged torture in order to enable the Attorney-General to
institute criminal proceedings against the person who is
alleged to have committed the torture.”.

(2) in the proviso to subsection (3) thereof, by the substitution for the
words “eighteen months.” of the words “twelve months.”;

(3) by the repeal of subsection (5) thereof and the substitution therefor
of the following subsection:-

“(5) An order made by the Minister under subsection (1)
shall be final and shall not be called in question in any
proceedings or in any court of law, save and except in
proceedings under Article 126 or 140 of the Constitution.”.

7. Section 14 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed.
\

8. Section 15 of the principal enactment is hereby amended by the addition
immediately after subsection (2) thereof, of the following new subsection:-

“(3) Every trial under this Act shall be held on a day to day
basis, unless in the opinion of the court exceptional circumstances
warrant postponement of the commencement or continuation of trial,
for reasons which shall be recorded by court.”.

9. Section 15A of the principal enactment is hereby amended in subsection (H

thereof, by the substitution for the words and fi gures “section 19(a)”, of the word and
figure “section 197,




Insertion of 10. The following new section is hereby inserted immediately after section 154

?gg ?:ig:n of the principal enactment and shall have effect as section 15B of that enactment: -

principal
enactment

“Grant of bail 15B. Notwithstanding anything to the contrary

tojpersons in in the provisions of this Act, if the trial against a person

dori . .

;Z’;?iozr " remanded or detained under this Act has  not
commenced after the expiration of twelve months, from
the date of arrest, the Court of Appeal may release such
person on bail, upon an application in that behalf, made
by the suspect or an Attorney- at-Law on his behalf:

Provided however, the preceding provisions
of this section shall not preclude the High Court from
making an order to remand any person under subsection
(2) of section 15, until conclusion of the trial:

Provided further, where the trial against an
accused in respect of whom the indictment has been
forwarded and filed in the High Court, has not
commenced after the expiration of twelve months from
the date of such filing, the High Court may consider to
release such person on bail, upon an application in that

_ behalf made by the accused or an Attorney- at-Law on
} his behalf.".
Replacement 1L Section 19 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed and the following
of section 19 . &
section is substituted therefor:-
of the
principal
enactment

“Provisions of 19. Notwithstanding the provisions of any other

any written . . ) R

faw relating to written law, evenjy person conv1ct§d by an‘y court of any

the grant of offence under this Act shall, notwithstanding that he has

bail not 1o lodged a petition of appeal against his conviction or the
apply to . d hi be k )
persons sentence imposed on him, be kept on remand until the
accused of any determination of the appeal:

offence under

this Act

Provided however. that the Court of Appeal
may in exceptional circumstances release on bail any



Replacement

of section 26
of the
principal
enactment

Amendment
of section 31
of the
principal
enactment

Sinhala text
to prevail in
case of
inconsistency

such person subject to such conditions as the Court of
Appeal may deem fit .”.

12. Section 26 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed and the
following section is substituted therefor:-

“Protection of

26. (1) An order made or direction given under this
officers & c.

Act may be questioned in proceedings under Article 126
or Article 140 of the Constitution.

(2) Subject to the provisions of subsection (1), no
suit, prosecution or other proceeding, civil or criminal,
shall lie against any officer or person for any act or thing
in good faith done or purported to be done in pursuance

or supposed pursuance of any order made or direction
given under this Act.”.

13. Section 31 of the principal enactment is hereby amended as follows:-

(1) by the repeal of the definition of the expression “newspaper”;

(2) by the repeal of the definition of the expression “printing press”;
and

(3) by the insertion immediately after the definition “specified person” of
\ the following definition:-

“torture” shall have the same meaning assigned to such expression
under the Convention Against Torture and other Cruel,

Inhumane or'degrading Treatment or Punishment Act, No.22
of 1994;”.

14. In the event of any inconsistency between the Sinhala and Tamil texts of
this Act, the Sinhala text shall prevail.




FOREIGN MINISTRY
CABINET MEMORANDUM

@ BeROCBG seedn gom:FM/A4/22/CM/04

1979 gom 48 ¢S 5edDw O1612886® (90298 8880m) smvm

3€I 3.0 RIND)

1. 598®

1.1 PuD BOes BOITVewsy & 88T 98un mdmy ¢ gom: 21/2121/310/019 esw
202] ©¢®38 03 8nB @ 9eBOCBe s-odnwd amnd, gz OB E®
B8x¥ 08 2022-01-10 &0 Boewad (ii) odew 08, gog vmvrf 0mYdum 3@
DeEDCed Bem 3 BO wew 06 BBeBOSw: B85 A ®6m C¢ eHOH®
O0INOw wwdme ©dw Bodn g@msDiw vwow e88us mom eEw Bedn
eCODIWD Bewln megs.

12 & qpd, BB endurf edmem 8829 0mQOusl 0md ¢dws? S cq oot
emJOLD w50 0widn ©-00dd5) geBRH® DBOENDD BONB 620D BO 3O
238z ©d BBHeBOSw BB Byt »0m ¢ PaEOH® O0EG% wuvBzmed
BOvnsf BEeDHEH ‘g v ‘a0’ 1:1845® 0ces 988uw m0m Ced.

2. Hbedwws
WD WO1ER HIRBEEO evnm,

(@) en@g,@ ‘@’ 8 wepst 1979 gomw 48 ¢om peEfmdce D1eBe® (m00508m
BBBm) soyd eseeridns BBe® vus emYBLD eews;

() ©9® oo ewPdud Mwd vyed veRBO esem; wn
(q) 68 oo ewOun am® B 0360 BEEeOTRD wHEDd SO wewo

g DHOCBG @B godSer 8.

gl meg ®wbln 8.0, 83, 5.0
Bedn g

2022 55808 20 OB &




FOREIGN MINISTRY
CABINET MEMORANDUM

QAOOEFF T USH T @ 6v: FM/A4/22/CM/04

1979 @)60r LIWRISITITS SenL &&1L Lh (BM&medls ehum@aser) ©)6v.48 @) 60T

° °

151 &5 61T

1. edrevrevuil

1.1

1.2

CLHGMSS e wib Oz TLIL6b 03 QFDUT 2021 46510 6T6TeOTTeD FWF LIS aIiLL L
SIMOFFTEUL LSBT @6v: 21/2121/310/019 QFBTLILI; Q&eTray FLLIDTSLIFTey
UPEISUULL rfweenioliyg FTTOSWLET  FiL aueneilemeruid,

QeuellpriLenwnssifler L6TL_T5 MWD EF Temeuu N eor unfl@eusmevra's@ét_

FUIUANSGLID 10012022 SsSUIL.L S{OWEFTO BILOTOTER6T LIHE (ii)
eLOGVIDITE Qeuef B Lemn &S eir QCIEFULBIITET(H 5 SemFFIeneuuileormey
2 ggrell LUl Lg.

AFOTLG, FLL 6UMTEHTTEH elenreyQEFwnLL L. &l L1h LOBLUGSSLLLE,
WareLMAWLLL L  B(BSS RS AT WVOLUIDHEG  WretTTeTenea VeV
STETLIEN S 2 PLLGSSRGTD QFeTI  FULOT AHUTTL  upmIsLILL L
S TFWeemIDLILF gnerigifler Vo8 eetTmiLer WaDGW @emerliLser ‘g
LOHDID ‘Y’ 2.8 GRCS FFUSsLUL B eTeTe.

2. ufbBsieny

\

Gmm@gﬂumt_n_mmmmés BBESB NS TR

(=0

(=)
@)

@emewriiy ‘e @ewdter 1979 QT LWRISTMNS SLEFLLID (5HEHT0S
FHOUTES6T) @)6v.48 G)6br @@55@55@5365nm FLL euenyey

FLL uenyellenar euissinmefludley L& iflgs6y; byt

FLL suemrellemenr QAREETTSE DO 6T LM TEBLOETHSEHI) L6Temeus s

& Wb ha meor SMDEFF T MG HTLD CHEMIULGRMS!.

(eLiLiLh)
Gugm. gl.eteb LTflehy, Lime_
QeuefiBTL® Qyemwsar

20 g3evreurfl 2022




