Cw8oni

o5 @«ﬁ&)c 28w

SIMDFFTMEU UVIQILBLD
OFFICE OF THE CABINET OF MINISTERS

~ CABINET DECISION g®ns DENE Bo®me MmESTMSH gqmmm
. Ped gome: 8®s/21/2121/310/019 2022 2008 ®es 11 8.
80w |

S50l eEmd.
8@ eC™O.

8eC g@msr-ned eEm®.
BoeamBss.

Bwo D€ @n:

g PeBdced eEm®.
Bedn gPimsrned eFmd.

1979 g 48 ¢ PO O1EOed
2Oz B20 BE8 ) £3:0®

(Bodn 05 #0858 988 e 2021-12-03 &8 e3-0q0ws)

2022 55008 ©es 03 & HOTNeE @ VR dedded2 Oed
Boemw gdas mOyn ecwr 0d wdy O gB.

\
/
g

D2E0.00\B.08. gm0zl
e®os DeEced eEnd.

32. oo OeOC sfmo g 21/2121/310/019 §, “1979 goz 48
¢0 EnDIw DIESded (20mBm BBBDH) vBYB® EW

Beeaddmn”’ @ Sews’ Bedn ®Bn® @Box we

2021-12-03 wA weedas - (¢®s g 21/1098/303/082

880cd § 2021-06-21 n B @@ OeFOE Bewwd ¢oED)

Bodn ¢ OBn® u18e B3 ABOWE 02O0HOO ©B®O
R0y Bées, Bgw Ad®O »E v c&.

B me 9  ¢Oms Oedced eCn®
Beda g@imBo-aw®

8oum: 8eC 3@o2280°R .

e®® Boesw maazs'faecozsf 01856 olw-@é zsd «:125’5@0 q‘,Scms ed 5»® BmSenmS 0112325279 ewd 0112422276

e 2 m e RADA SR




A decision of the Cabinet Meeting held on 2022.01.03

32

Cabinet Paper No.21/2121/310/019, a Memorandum dated
2021-12-03 by the Foreign Minister on "Amendments to the
Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act, No.48 of
1979" - (Cabinet decision dated 2021-06-21 on CP
No.21/1098/303/082 refers) was deferred for the next meeting, to be
taken up for consideration when the Foreign Minister is present.

Action by: Secretary to the Cabinet
Foreign Ministry

Copied to: My/Finance

Checked by 31 M

#0000eiunionossvia

i




AR MY MR IO BEVIM YA R

FOREIGN MINISTRY
CABINET MEMORANDUM

q®mns OeHDEBW eeeq® aem:FM/A4/21/CM 23

1979 goz 48 ¢om BEdmdcw Dr1e1EBe® (5002082 B880m) BBIB) WEW9
£300RIDB

1. »53d®

1.1. pedmDoges wy) eOHEOD GO W DB 008 DB »ESmWB. yéOBuried
2 BBOB®O i Bewe goutsr WO amEns & fm gD vy BEO
s®asRews 58wd aB®wns ww wBlen DoBO gio.

1.2. 200208 8000z ece 1979 & o500 G4 5D O1ESOe® v, 800 8uws?
godter BES 6y guddmddsio Y 5080 eews gued BowddmenmndEd 8w
esIB00 ys Drewsy pum B gi». omee ednn, § Comned pEn Boddd BB
w®wscms BEIG epad@ema B D2 60O e VO WS BB, B)eSm D
Bedned ond 50 88w E® Bedyed ydeom ¥ B edoewst @E€8wd

©®5Y eZ00 eBZNOD.

1.3. 8 am®, 1979 gom 48 ¢S Efmdagw NEBDe® (20mEm DBDm) 62> NOD
SoBams BBO wews gl OB amy 890 ol BEO 66w §ow
MOD/CP/PAC/106/2021 ¢62» w0 2021.06.18 8B Sm0dqQ g®ams P8
wood®@n ¢S BrndeB v goCem g®msdSw, Beq® 3o DCWI &Y
g8mcen qe@oﬁﬁs@doso 883 988u mom c&.

1.4. 83D, eon wews’ B SRR gOun ©e3DEB® w.ed®wd and, e M1
and, i

g. (1) a@zﬁm pEmOige EURDEd vHB t300@d D0 mOsTesie symews 50
BB et egien’s wrisy BEAG ¢m» ® D00 BBedn 9eBunl B8O
eseeo g@om O3B gm0 vl BEO

(2) womem, Boda »OER, §dWCe ©Y Owm qilmd 6B g mBrdE
Aecd8nesicns? 00sidn Aechdsied 390 o :S1eIO

86w gBOS S508eBH®0 e B1080 v

@0t s anEd BBede 68n Dbmd g®md DD 00 @elunl /OO
wew g OB gn®mEYO0 DCW 5:08®

&o.

wewr g DeOEw 88T 2021.6.21 8538 any®Bo A 0§ C&-

Foreign Ministry, Republic Building, Colombo 1, Sri Lanka
Tal- 104119420771 4+04-11-23754172 Fax: +94-11-2430222




2. HwodBaw

2

2.2

2.3

2.4

2.9

2.6

2.7

2.8

a®ms OHEDCBo an@Benss emnKD, dendud odm® B8x3 2021.06.24 oA
88wt 8857 qpoem gdmmrecd e@m@ed wswmulsdews gnd gdmde,
Owesm grdzfed ww Bodn ®OGH @D OB RIC @0, enE8w;, BBsH
0etobmedsInd, BB emQPur wdmgm vy HBD DB B Wy GPeHHOE
BEeBiens? a®@sidn »890n ol mdm C8&.

Rends mOYed etclnvn ne 50D g@mmen wv Rewddmenm gnd god
cBedan sDOD 3¢ gnd, 882 exlBed wy FOW vHPed BB @R RSO
omDDO e WHEWOCO aPE gBelm PpunmdEst 1850 Bedseg q@g@i
wcdm c2.

020 A8 ®8Yed Bbedn w@ecidmne BBO wews 2021.10.07 & gB0d
BnSeBn® B8xf Bodw ¢@msdimed wweddewsy 4nd gdmns dedbcie
az) 890 v mS» &

Rendsied ®8Jed D8mod 2021.11.15 B &» Sodesin® wwv g
OO0 amBY o8Bt ww Brnisd odm® 0dn eilurd BB ce

Bedsted »8Jed ewldrn o@ecdmwe BBe@sY i D, ¢®ims DB
a8 endced EGedsin NGOG wu genmy S gunm ©¥
Deduwds ©®w DEd CBe{eD OSBe. pEedige DigEde® smBO
©cddm wenddn 80TVt § o BB emdusl ewd, § Com BB
3e0® 5w BBE 00t medtne® 8d» ¢ ¢®ms OHDCBe anHBYD womDB
alazzsf&_s\. wEm NGO wewn owadtizn HdmD oy O 988usf B8O BB 3

om.

008 HdBw admmed &, nQw® ‘&’ 8 gngas ®J &8 888, @i DO
eOn 988unf BBOD Budn pundogs NEUSDe® s Bewm ewddn weondddn,
2@ 08w grm8D BBxY emel om0d gdwsY 6O g1».

8 Eoned pdn Deddd BB wdvgmwd 0 6ed DB geryms BB o
osr¥nd BBt ew BB v8DwsT grres O HDO wudm OO Béoes et 0B
a0t @d 308 BB wemo @mm W Dmeme 0087 8085 HOEWMOEO
anmcd® wew §B» Budds ecn 0®® Blwe p.oaddmned e8un O C1ed.

2@ DB gum89D B85 000 ewlln w-erddm 8E0e¢d gBond
S Bn® W woEen Orn® ©wdw WD 60 §B ¢nd, On®ed
uen OmomMDs HAD an@Bw wgws gOB ®edE®w 00 @e8urf @m0 #1».



3. Bedww

D DSBS BB 53 Om vz N Ee® g®ms D80 a»8YeD wwIsBDdw
DREWST,

(@) @®«w® ‘g 8 Qe aB 082, ewldn weoadm anes mo®, puEmdg
Netde® smm .eaddH® BBO wew svmH emPden e BEO wgwr BB

em®un a®BgmDIwO coees &®

(a0) pES>ORD DestBo® von wenddnse BOe® s emidsn g Be c.%qam
=58 Ee@Ind w§ed IO

wewo g@ms OeFDCBw an@Bw goduie mSE.

ant.meg: Owdba 8.0, 8863, ©0.8.
Bodon g@omw

2021 eee®a8 03

3
‘




FOREIGN MINISTRY
CABINET MEMORANDUM

Cabinet Memorandum No: Fm | A4 ] 21 [¢m]23

Amendments to the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary

Provisions) Act No. 48 of 1979

1. Background

1.1

1.2

1.3

1.4

Terrorism is a dynamic, evolving threat. The Government has a paramount
and complex obligation in ensuring national security, while protecting the
rights and freedoms of citizens.

The PTA, enacted in 1979 as a temporary measure, has been instrumental in
guiding our agencies in protecting citizens and prosecuting perpetrators.
However, this four-decade old legislation which is the cornerstone of Sri
Lanka’s counter terrorism legislation, has not kept pace with the
developments in the sphere of terrorism, nor the sphere of human rights
obligations.

Accordingly, a Joint Cabinet Memorandum MOD/CP/PAC/106/2021 dated
18.06.2021v~(as submitted by HE the President and Minister of Defence,
Foreign Minister and -Minister of Justice, titled Appointment of a Capinet Sub
Committee to revisit the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act
No. 48 of 1979.

Subsequently, approval was granted by the Cabinet of Ministers dated
21.6.2021, pursuant to the afgrementioned Joint Cabinet Memorandum, inter
alia, '

a. Authorizing HE the President to:

(1) Appoint a Cabinet Sub-Committee to recommend to the Cabinet of
Ministers whether to amend the existing PTA or to introduce a new
law

(2) Appoint an officials’ committee comprising representatives of the
Ministries of Defence, Foreign Affairs, Justice and Public Security

b. Authorizing the Cabinet Sub Committee to submit its report with
recommendation to the Cabinet of Ministers within three months

Foreign Ministry, Republic Building, Colombo 1, Sri Lanka.




2. Process

2.1

2.2

2.3

2.4

2.5

2.6

2F

Following the Cabinet approval, Secretary to the President appointed an
Officials’ Committee by letter dated 24.6.2021, chaired by Secretary to the
Ministry of Defence, and officials from the Ministries of Justice, Public Security

and Foreign Affairs, as well as Police, AG’s Department, Legal Draftsman and

the Chief of National Intelligence.

Extensive consultations were conducted among different Ministries and
agencies in the context of the Officials Committee, where further expertise was
called from additional institutions relating to the matters of discussion, including
different branches of the Police and Tri-Forces.

The Cabinet Sub Committee was appointed by HE the President on 07.10.2021
chaired by the Foreign Minister to review the recommendations of the Officials

Committee.

The report of the Officials’ Committee was submitted to the President and the
members of the Cabinet Sub-Committee and Secretary to the President on
15.11.2021.

Having reviewed the proposals of the Officials’ Committee, the Cabinet Sub
Committee conducted further consultations with selected Parliamentarians and
other government agencies and experts. The Cabinet Sub Committee also
conducted discussions on the proposed amendments to the PTA with the Law
Commission of Sri Lanka, Bar Association of Sri Lanka and civil society groups.
Proposals were received for consideration verbally and through written
submissions. .

At the conclusion of this process, the Cabinet Sub Committee has finalized the
proposed amendments {o thé PTA to be submitted to the Cabinet attached at
Annex A.

These amendments are presented as an initial step in amending this law, to
bring it in line with contemporary and evolving developments in order to
safeguard national security, and to bring the PTA in line with other laws of the
country as well as to ensure that Sri Lanka's counter terrorism legislation
incorporates international standards and best practices.




28 The Cabinet Sub Committee has discussed these proposed amendments
with HE the President and Minister of Defence, and are submitted to Cabinet

for approval with his full concurrence.

3. Recommendation

In my capacity as the Chair of the Cabinet Sub Committee to Revisit the PTA, the /
approval of the Cabinet of Ministers is sought to:

(a) direct the Legal Draftsman to prepare the Bill to amend the PTA,
incorporating the proposed amendments, as attached at Annex A;

(b) place the Bill amending the PTA before Parliament for approval.

Prof. G Lfeiris P

- ..
Forexgn Minister

03" December 2021




Short title

Amendment
of section 9
of Act,
No.48 of
1979

Insertion of
sections 9a
and 9B in the
principal
enactment

ﬂ-l/}l.ll

Annex A

4

AN ACT TO AMEND THE PREVENTION OF TERRORISM
(TEMPORARY PROVISIONS) ACT, NO.48 of 1979

BE it enacted by the Parliament of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka as
follows:-

1. This Act may be cited as the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions)
(Amendment) Act, No. of2021.

2. Section 9 of the Prevention of Terrorism (Temporary Provisions) Act, No. 48
of 1979 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal enactment”) is hereby amended in the
proviso to subsection (1) thereof, by the substitution for the words “eighteen months.”
of the words “twelve months.”.

3. The following new sections are hereby inserted immediately after section 9 of
the principal enactment and shall have effect as sections 9A and 98 of that enactment:

| “Certified copy 9A. (1) A certified copy of the order made under
| Ofthedelention  section 9 shall be made available within a reasonable
served on the period to the Magistrate within whose judicial division
Magistrate the place of detention of the person in respect of whom
such order relates is situated, for the Magistrate to visit

such place of detention, in terms of section 9B.
(2) The detention of any person under section 9
shall be communicated to the Human Rights
Commission of Sri Lanka in terms of section 28 of the
Human Rights Commission of Sri Lanka Act, No. 21 of
1996, for the persons authorized by the Human Rights
Commission of Sri Lanka to visit the place of detention

in terms of that Act.

Duty of the 9B. (1) It shall be the duty of every Magistrate who
3?;%’;;’;?:? has received a certified copy of a detention order in
detention terms of subsection (1) of section 94, to visit the place

1




Replacement
of section 10
of the
principal
enactment

of detention of the person to whom the order relates (in
this section referred to as the “suspect”) at least once in
every month during the period of detention, to ensure
that the suspect is protected to the extent provided for
in the Convention Against Torture and other Cruel,
Inhumane or degrading Treatment or Punishment Act,
No.22 of 1994.

(2) For the purpose of subsection (1), the
Magistrate who visits any place of detention, shall —

(a) personally see the suspect, and look into
his wellbeing, welfare and conditions
under which he is kept at such place of
detention;

(b) record the observations of the suspect and
any complaint the suspect may make;

(3) Where the Magistrate is of the opinion, that the
suspect may have been subjected to torture, the
Magistrate may direct that the suspect be produced
before a Judicial Medical Officer for medical
examination, and a report be submitted by such Judicial
Medical Officer to the Magistrate.

(4) Where the report of such Judicial Medical

. Officer reveals that the suspect has been subjected to

torture, the Magistrate shall make an appropriate order,
to provide necessary medical treatment to the suspect.

(5) The Magistrate may also direct the Inspector
General of Police to commence an investigation into the
alleged torture in order to enable the Attorney-General
to institute criminal proceedings against the person who
is alleged to have committed the torture.”.

4. Section 10 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed and the following
section is substituted therefor:-



Insertion of
sections 10A
in the
principal
enactment

Amendment
of section 11
of the
principal
enactment

“Order under 10. An order made under section 9 shall be final

;e:;:‘m Sk and shall not be called in question in any proceedings
or in any court of law, save and except in proceedings
under Article 126 or 140 of the Constitution.”.

5, The following new section is hereby inserted immediately after section 10 of
the principal enactment and shall have effect as sections 10A of that enactment: -

“An attorney- 10A. (1) An Attorney- at- Law representing a
’:;;:‘:e:';g the person remanded or detained under this Act, shall
have access to have the right of access to such person and to make
a person in representations on behalf of such person, subject to

remand or in

detention such conditions as may be prescribed by regulations

made under this Act or as provided for in other
written law.

(2) A person remanded or detained under
this Act shall have the right to communicate with
his relatives, as provided for in written law.”.

6. Section 11 of the principal enactment is hereby amended as follows:-

(1) by the insertion immediately after subsection (1) thereof, of the
\ following subsections:-

"(1A) The person to whom an order made under subsection
(1) relates, shall be produced before a Judicial Medical Officer
for medical examination before serving such order to such
person and a report be submitted by the Judicial Medical
Officer in respect of such person.

(1B) An order made under subsection (1) shall be served
on the person to whom the order relates, by the Magistrate in
whose judicial division such person resides and the report of
the Judicial Medical Officer referred to in subsection (1A) shall
be produced before the Magistrate to ensure that such person
has not been subjected to torture before serving such order on
such person.




Repeal of
section 14 of
the principal
enactment

Amendment
of section 15
of the
principal
enactment

Amendment
of section
15A0f the
principal
enactment

(1C) Where the report issued by the Judicial Medical
Officer under subsection (1A) reveals that such person has been
subjected to torture, the Magistrate shall make an appropriate
order to provide necessary medical treatment to such person.

(1D) The Magistrate may also direct the Inspector
General of Police to commence an investigation into the
alleged torture in order to enable the Attorney-General to
institute criminal proceedings against the person who is
alleged to have committed the torture.”.

(2) in the proviso to subsection (3) thereof, by the substitution for the
words “eighteen months.” of the words “twelve months.”;

(3) by the repeal of subsection (5) thereof and the substitution therefor of
the following subsection:-

“(5) An order made by the Minister under subsection (1)
shall be final and shall not be called in question in any
proceedings or in any court of law, save and except in
proceedings under Article 126 and 140 of the Constitution.”.

7. Section 14 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed.

8. Section 15 of the principal enactment is hereby amended by the addition
immediately after subsection'(2) thereof, of the following new subsection:-

“(3) Every trial under this Act shall be held on a day to day basis,
unless in the opinion of the court exceptional circumstances warrant
postponement of the commencement or continuation of trial, for
reasons which shall be recorded by court.”.

9. Section 15A of the principal enactment is hereby amended by the substitution
for the words and figure “section 19(a)”, of the words and figure “section 19”.



Insertion of *10. The following new section is hereby inserted immediately after section

158 ls:c‘tl::" 15A of the principal enactment and shall have effect as sections 158 of that

principal enactment: -
enactment

“Grant of bail 15B. Notwithstanding anything to the contrary in

to persons in the provisions of this Act, if the trial against a person

remand or in remanded or detained under this Act has not

detention commenced after the expiration of twelve months,
from the date of arrest, the Court of Appeal may
release such person on bail, upon an application in
that behalf, made by the suspect or an attorney at law
on his behalf:

Provided however, the preceding provisions of
this section shall not preclude the High Court from
making an order to remand any person under
subsection (2) of section 15, until conclusion of the
trial:

Provided further, where the trial against an
accused in respect of whom the indictment has been
forwarded and filed in the High Court, has not
commenced after the expiration of twelve months
from the date of such filing, the High Court may
consider to release such person on bail, upon an
application in that behalf made by the accused or an
attorney at law on his behalf.".

Amendment 11. Section 19 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed and the following

ggf}f:m“ 19" section is substituted therefor:-

principal
enactment

“Provisions of 19. Notwithstanding the provisions of any other written

any written law .
: n
relating to the law, every person convicted by any court of any offence

grant of bail not under this Act shall, notwithstanding that he has lodged
apply to persons a petition of appeal against his conviction or the sentence
accused of any . . ;
ofence uhder imposed on him, be kept on remand until the
this Act determination of the appeal :




Replacement
of section 26
of the
principal
enactment

Amendment
of section 31
of the
principal
enactment

Sinhala text
to prevail in
case of

inconsistency

Provided however, that the Court of Appeal may in
exceptional circumstances release on bail any such
person subject to such conditions as the Court of Appeal
may deem fit .”.

12. Section 26 of the principal enactment is hereby repealed and the
following section is substituted therefor:-

“Protection of
officers & ¢.

26. (1) An order made or direction given under this Act
may be questioned in proceedings under Article 126 or
Article 140 of the Constitution.

(2) Subject to the provisions of subsection (1), no
suit, prosecution or other proceeding, civil or criminal,
shall lie against any officer or person for any act or thing
in good faith done or purported to be done in pursuance
or supposed pursuance of any order made or direction
given under this Act.”.

13. Section 31 of the principal enactment is hereby amended as follows:-
(1) by the repeal of the definition of the expression “newspaper”;

(2) by the repeal of the definition of the expression “printing press”;
\ and

(3) by the insertion immediately after the definition “specified person” of the
following definition:-

“torture” shall have the same meaning assigned to such expression
under the Convention Against Torture and other Cruel,
Inhumane or degrading Treatment or Punishment Act, No.22

- of 1994;”.

14. In the event of any inconsistency between the Sinhala and Tamil texts of
this Act, the Sinhala text shall prevail.




FOREIGN MINISTRY
CABINET MEMORANDUM

S{eFFTemneult LSHT @ eV:FM/4/21/CM/23

1979 @607 48 1D @6VEHS LIWIMISTOUNS Se0LE &1L & GR60 (5 Mhemed s

IMLITR&6iT) §) (158 5585 6ir

1. 9 edreorevnt]

1.1

L2

1.3

14

LIS FeUNSLD eTeiTLIS! @)W &euThmeieerT, QUG T IH&IUBLD BJ&F &M1& S60TS LD,
BITL® wasafler 2 flemnsanerib FHHH IHOBUD UNGISTEGL 2G5 Calame,
CaxHW UNsISETU®L 2 MIBLLGSaILD WSBNILDTETSHILD §) 885 60T60TEI LD T6uT
SLULMR STFTHISSHNE 2 i@,

1979 @6V R HMH&H MO BLEUIQHED S UITS QUOMULILL UWKISTNS SenL g
FLLIDTETS!, G408 56T LIMSISTLILIE sy & MT6U0T LD IT6OT6U [T & 60)6T 5>

ST LILEISILD 6TLOSI (NS EUTENIDLILIE 565G audleaml Heude e

&GOSR 6TENSI. 2LeTGLUTH e, @) 6unhien s er UWBISTEUNS IS FliLs
FLLSHME 19 LILIEOILLITET BT SETUSH STV LIDEOLOWITET E)HS
FLLOUMESOMETS], QUETTHSIUBL LIWMISTeungLD 3isveugl ellg 2 flemng
sLULNG&efler QFwe Hang T Guibun@seafler CousHSSIL 60T ©) 66T HES S ML
GuigmruLeilsuemev.

SISETLI, "1979 G)6T 48 Splh @eVES LILIBISTEUTS (BH&HMOS JHUTH&ET) Sl &
FLLSS WaTufGaenear QFiIsSHE @ IIMDFEFTEOR 2.1 Gpelleneor

B SG60’ et SemevlILNL L, 18.06.2021 251D B &G, MOD/CP/PAC/106/2021 eT6drn)
Q&S n B SMFFTOCIL USHTLH et GH G LaoTTHILIS),
QaeflprlLennds], B siemwdsy s CwmflLb FFUNlESUILL LS.

CuHGMHIUILL & G SiewsEsFramar LSS FD FuullEstul L angs
QSBTLFHS, 21.06.2021 gu1b H&H) Netrou@euemaumi b BFISES! SENDEFF TR
QRESTIID UpRISLIUL L 8;

2. G5E REMHLE LdramaarabrhHe B & Trwnealsse;

4.

D& 60T GULIETET LILIMBISJOUNS SML& FL.L GG HmHBIUST S6veva LS
FLLID @6TenD SIMWSLILGS S ugT CTEOTLIENS SIEOLDEFFT6UEHE
uflBE@IUIUSDETS @@ SMDEFFETE6 2 1 Gwened Bl g6

B siemnds, QeueflBml.( ojewnss:, LIMSISTLUL eDWFs Iman
QUTSING &ET LINSISTLIL] Sennd & & weumnledam b s Wremssener

2 6TeT_&HW R B ST S G Bwdssea

SIDFFTENG 2 L1 SUOUTEIS ADTMI TGS S eer uflbsiempuL.er  &esl

MGG NWE FLFUILNSSNHE SDEFTNUHES B G TTLO6TSS60.

Foreign Ministry, Republic Building, Colombo 1, Sri Lanka
Tel: +94-11-2430221, +94-11-2325412 Fax: +94-11-2430222




2. Qeligpsmm

2.1 S EFFeaneuulletr SREHTISEMmeaTS QGTLIHS, garmHuiHuileT Qauwevmery
24.06.2021 QLD BEHI HIGSSHET eP6VLD, LTSS TUIL] AN FRT QEFUIeTeTan TS
ST TS BE), QUNTSIDESET LMSISTUL, QeualBITL (5 28616086 25w
S EFE S ST 2FsTHeEEEL6T, QuTedlsh, FLLIOT HHUT Henardsentd, st
UENIERT MHMID GSEIW LJevaTmle] Seneveu 8w S & TiflEemnend Q& mesri
20 Gl BIWIOSSTT.

22 sipsrflser Gupeiler LeaTerentlufe, QleuelGoumi S{eMDF & &66T IDMHMILD
WP&EUTNLOLILSSET LSBTV el fleumeT 2LCMTFeneurs: 6T LG LILIL LT, HEIG
QuInedlen MmN oL sealler QeueuGaum Blenearaar 2 L LiL, GL6VE & Lo TeT
Wlmieurisef) b SeubsienTuwimg, 65l Wi&eT QGTLILITET GLguiD BlLeRTdsiouLd
QUL LS.

23 B srflsdar @upeller uflbgsianpsaner enmley QFUIMGSDHTH, QeuelBmi(h
SMNEFFMTS HMEUTTHS QEBTERTL. HENOFFTN6 2 LI Gupeumenrg: 07.10.2021
216010 QLS LeTTHuBmey Bluwtslsa i L gl

24 siBerifleer Gueller oymlsenawimens, 15.11.2021 2j6Tm), garmT&H U,
serTH LS U Qawenary wHmID SWwEsFgmel 2.1 Gupaller 2 mitiflery
p@CwrflLid sufullssiul L g

25 oBsrflsr @upeilar werQwriflesanar WeTmUiey QFUIS {eDLOEFTme 2 L
Guarars, OsflayGeEwiul L uTgreseaTm 2 mufeariser, Wm FFTmhs
(PE&EUISHEISET WHmLD Blyswurjseflith Gmesmesor(h 2,6V Ta6neTs:enaT
BLISHIS. LWRISTEUNS SL sl LERDOEHT WerQumBluiiu’ L
S (BHSSBIGET GMGS HMDFFFN 2 LI GULOOD BVHNS FLL LN HSW,
BOVHENS FLLSSTeull&6T FRGH HMID Feileh Fens G5 HEBL.-SILD
Q,BaunganeTgamer BLASH W sl UHElLgH&mer wWerGinmisle|ser,
wn&@wm{raaeum 6T1(LDS B! LPEULDITET FIOFUILIGSSEV&HET CLNEULDMSHYD QUIMLILILL 60T,

26 @&QFWLIWEMUNET WeN6s, MFFTanaulsh @ememTiiL] 'S’ 38
@emeTd s lIUL G FFUNSSEIULEETET LWRISIaNS L F&FL L &5 6T
weTQMBAWLLLL BHSSHISHE6T, HDDFFTO 2 U G
QoBULESS W ETeTS!. ‘

27 @b% FLLESMS DHESSUSDHSTAT QTOL SLLIOTS QBS H(HHSMmI&6T
(PETEMEUE S LILIGEETHET, @8 CHHIW LIMSISTLINL UMSISTLULSDSETS FLO&T6)
WO QUETHES! QUBLD (LPETEETHMESHEBSGS ML Q& T (h UHRISMHELD, HITL1.60T
LD FLLBISEHEH IS LWBSETaNS SLEFLLSMS s meor()

UGBS DHGIONS, @evmiensuller LWmBIGTans aTHFULE FLLID FIuCHE
STHEnEEET IDHMID FDBHS HEOLLNNDEHENET 2 6TaTL_ SIS,

28 oemEFTE 2 U Guoeunarsl, paraumdwitiul L @hs HpSSmsET GMisSs!,
GGG QETTH LS, LTSISTLIL HODEFT SHCWIMTHILLD SeVHSITULT, S60T
W SBESETISHNEHTE Senaramauuis FFULNeEsiul QleTersl.




3. uflbsieny

WIS TOUTS SHenLEFL LGNS LBeTMile] QalleusMe mer SennFsIensy 2 LIGWeller Senevaul
6601 euenHUileL LiletTeumeuaTauH b & Tar HRGsTID Canylu@eme:

9) @emewriy ‘'S @ WerQLmMPAWULLL SHESSHIGET  RUBER TS SMIDES,
LWBISTOUTS SMHLFFLLSMS HHSSUSHETOT FlLepdans sWriliius He,
FLL DIGBHSS 2 55760H/F6

QL) UWBISTeUTS FOLEEFL LGRS FLLEDOLS NS SRBHTISENHEHMS
LI ITEBLOETISEH 60 (LDEOTEN 615 5 6V. '

(ENSHEUITLILILD)
Supm.gl.erev LFrfletv
QeueflBT (B e FFT

03 W& 2021




